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EXHIBIT B 
 
ISSUE STATEMENT: PUBLIC HEARING AND POSSIBLE VOTE CONCERNING THE 

PROPOSED REZONE OF 1101 N KENNETH ST FROM M-1 (LIGHT 
MANUFACTURING) TO HC (HIGHWAY COMMERCIAL) ZONING 
DISTRICT 

 
DATE: NOVEMBER 4, 2024 
 
SUBMITTED BY: LINDA RICE 
 
PRESENTED BY: PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT 
 
 
 
Background 
The property subject to the rezoning request is an unplatted lot located at the NW 
corner of the intersection of North Kenneth Street and West Kathryn Street. North 
Kenneth Street is an outer road adjacent to Highway 160. A vehicle maintenance 
facility was constructed in 1974, and the property has been used for bus storage, 
parking, and maintenance since that time. The property was voluntarily annexed in 
August of 1985. While not part of the Nixa Industrial Park, it was designated with M-1 
(Light Manufacturing) zoning at the time of that development. 
 
Analysis 

Surrounding Land Use 
The lots to the North and West are zoned M-1. To the East is Kenneth Street, Highway 
160, and on the east side of highway 160 is a Highway Commercial (HC) zoned lot. To 
the South is HC zoned property. Three of the four corners of a major intersection are 
zoned HC.   

Transportation 

The subject property is directly served by West Kathryn Street which is categorized as a 
Collector. The property is also accessible from North Kenneth Street and North Gerald 
Drive which are both local roads. 

Public Utilities (Water, Wastewater, Electric) 

The subject property is currently served by municipal water and wastewater, electric is 
supplied by another provider. If redevelopment were to occur, Nixa electric is readily 
available in the immediate area should they prefer to use it over the current provider.   

Other Considerations 

The change in zoning was requested due to the property owner fielding calls with 
commercial interest in the property for uses not allowable in an M-1 zoning district. To  
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staff’s knowledge there is no current plan for a change in use. Any future 
redevelopment of the property will require compliance with current development 
regulations.   
 
Recommendation 
This proposed rezone is consistent with zoning patterns in the vicinity, the other 3 corners 
of the intersection are zoned HC. According to section 117-99 the current use of the 
property is allowable in HC zoning as well. Staff recommends the approval of this 
rezone. 
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